
 

 
What Does It All Meme? 

Message 3: 
I Like Christ But 

Not Christians 
 
 
“Either this man was, and is, the Son of God, or else a madman or 
something worse. You can shut him up for a fool, you can spit at 
him and kill him as a demon or you can fall at his feet and call him 
Lord and God, but let us not come with any patronizing nonsense 
about his being a great human teacher. He has not left that open 
to us. He did not intend to.” - C.S. Lewis in “Mere Christianity” 
 
…“I am the way, the truth, and the life. No one comes to the 
Father except through Me.” - John 14:6 (Jesus speaking) 
 
 
Gandhi commented on a Jesus of his own  

___________________, not the Jesus of the _____________. 
 
 
Self-proclamation alone does not _______________ one’s  

_____________________. 
 
 
Argumentum Ad Hominem: 
 

…typically refers to a fallacious argumentative strategy whereby 
genuine discussion of the topic at hand is avoided by instead 
attacking the character, motive, or other attribute of the person 
making the argument, or persons associated with the argument, 
rather than attacking the substance of the argument itself. 
 
 
The fallacy of attacking the ________________ instead of  

the _____________________ is known as an “ad hominem  
argument”. 
 
 

 

In order to evaluate any religion or belief system, one  

must study the life of its _____________________, its sacred  

writings, and its ______________________. 
 
 
______________________ can do _______________________ 
in the name of anybody. 
 
If you want to judge Christianity, you have to judge 
Christ. 
 
 
Unlike Christians, atheists can commit _________________  

without _____________________ their worldview because  
eliminating competing groups would be a 
faithful expression of their worldview. 
 
 
“Not everyone who says to Me, ‘Lord, Lord,’ shall enter the 
kingdom of heaven, but he who does the will of My Father in 
heaven. Many will say to Me in that day, ‘Lord, Lord, have we not 
prophesied in Your name, cast out demons in Your name, and 
done many wonders in Your name?’ And then I will declare to 
them, ‘I never knew you; depart from Me, you who practice 
lawlessness!’” - Matthew 7:21-23 (Jesus speaking) 
 
 
Being a Christian means _____________________________ 
Jesus. 
 
“If anyone desires to come after Me, let him deny himself, and 
take up his cross daily, and follow Me.” - Luke 9:23 (Jesus speaking) 
 
 
Those who want to know the real Jesus must know  

___________________________. 
 
 
 


